


In 2009, Morgan and Morgan established the Business 
Trial Group with a simple, yet novel objective - provide 
clients with first-rate commercial litigation attorneys on 
a contingency-fee basis.

By combining the resources of a preeminent trial law 
firm with the expertise of career business lawyers, we 
have built a reputation for getting results by aggressive-
ly fighting for our clients.

BE ON A WINNING TEAM

We have recovered tens of millions of dollars on behalf 
of our clients. Our attorneys are skilled at taking com-
plex cases to trial, and have an established track  
record of success.

WORK WITH EXPERIENCED BUSINESS LITIGATORS

We provide the work product you expect from a top-ti-
er corporate firm. In fact, many of our attorneys have 
honed their craft at prominent national and internation-
al law firms.

HAVE THE RESOURCES TO TAKE ON ANY OPPONENT

We take on the most complex cases and well-funded 
adversaries. Whether it comes to staffing, technical 
experts, or our sophisticated document management 
system, we strive to give our clients an edge. 

ONLY PAY FOR RESULTS

We practice business litigation solely on a contingen-
cy-fee basis, so our compensation is directly tied to 
our client’s success. Our clients pay no attorneys’ fees 
unless we prevail.

AN ELITE TRIAL LAW FIRM

WHY WORK WITH THE BUSINESS TRIAL GROUP?

ABOUT MORGAN & MORGAN

 • Founded in 1988
 • 500 attorneys in 13 states
 • More than 50 offices, including 25 in Florida
 • The largest contingency-fee firm in the country
 • Recovered more than $5 billion for our clients
 • National Law Journal’s America’s Elite Trial Lawyers
 • Florida Powerhouse Law Firm by Law 360



NEARLY $10 MILLION RECOVERY FOR PROFESSIONAL 
MALPRACTICE AND SECURITIES CLAIMS

We represented investors who, based on the defen-
dants’ misrepresentations and inadequate diligence, 
were induced to make a significant investment in ex-
change for stock in a soon-to-be public company.  
We utilized our resources and expertise to recover 
nearly $10 million. 
 
$7.3 MILLION JUDGEMENT FOR COMMUNITY  
ASSOCIATION

We represented a community association of more than 
500 homeowners that had been fighting to fix their 
roadways and drainage systems for years.

We took over the case midway through the litigation, 
and after a three-week trial, a jury awarded the cost 
of repairing the roadways and drainage systems plus 
pre-judgement interest. 
 
$14.5 MILLION JURY VERDICT IN COMPLEX  
SHAREHOLDER DISPUTE

We represented an investor in a commercial real es-
tate venture who had been the victim of a corporate 
“squeeze-out” by the majority partner. The multi-party 
case involved claims for fraud, breach of fiduciary duty, 
and breach of contract. The Group’s resources allowed 
our client to go toe-to-toe with a far wealthier opponent 
for more than four years of litigation and win a jury 
verdict for $14.5 million.

DELIVERING SUCCESS FOR OUR CLIENTS

OUR PRIMARY PRACTICE AREAS INCLUDE:
 • Accountant Malpractice 
 • Contract Disputes
 • Construction and Engineering Litigation 
 • Employment Litigation
 • Intellectual Property
 • Investment Losses and Securities Litigation
 • Legal Malpractice
 • Probate, Trust & Estate Litigation
 • Real Estate Litigation
 • Shareholder and Partnership Disputes

WHAT TYPE OF CASES DO WE HANDLE?
The Business Trial Group has successfully prosecuted 
claims across the entire spectrum of commercial 
litigation.



OFFICES: ATLANTA | FT. LAUDERDALE | FT. MYERS | JACKSONVILLE |  MIAMI | ORLANDO| TAMPA | WEST PALM BEACH

BusinessTrialGroup.com | BTG@ForThePeople.com | 800.816.1031


